
ACROSS

 1 Felt rather aged after Operation 
Overlord (6,3,5)
 10 Relatives in usual hang-outs taking 
heroin (5)
 11 Reason pig gambols about in the 
country (9)
 12 Policeman detaining a Yankee for 
loitering? (7)
 13 European fast to bury Slormgorm in 
earth? (7)
 14 I write comments about heavyweight 
making a coming back (5)
 16 A large amount of snowfall? (9)
 19 A bloke hospital department fixed for 
good (9)
 20 A pine or hazel primarily? (5)
 22 Betters on one of the roulette colours 
and 29? (7)
 25 Socially aware seaside town to ban 
book (5-2)
 27 A group working noisily down in the 
pit? (9)
 28 Wind up speaker that is out of time (5)
 29 I’m erotic and I’ll pay o�  MP (8,6)

DOWN

 2 Network with one hiring players for 
City (9)
 3 Contrary Teacher greeting sage in 
India (5)
 4 Mark out bit of edging by indicator in 
Escort (9)
 5 Thin geriatrics passing around joint (5)
 6 A male with a gut wandering around in 
a state (9)
 7 King wanting horse and end to terrible 
weather? (5)
 8 House in field (7)
 9 Cloth rep raised charge? Very brazen 
ultimately! (6)
 15 A dragnet set up to snare old American 
criminal (4,5)
 17 Toxic gases Pam farted explosively (9)
 18 Unresponsive dude given a shot in the 
arm (9)
 19 Salesman turns up with document to 
complete? Go on! (7)
 21 Around end of July, polishes shades (6)
 23 City to stop youth getting put up for 
transfer (5)
 24 One involved with celebrity music 
producer (5)
 26 Greek having trouble in vessel (5)
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