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ACROSS

	1	 Position with good view of 
fighting gave guarding soldier 
purpose (7,5)
	10	 Have same opinion as 
top grade environmentalist 
protecting duck (5,2)
	11	 Press witness hedging 
question about key last letter 
(7)
	12	 American duffer’s last in rink 
getting difficult jump (5)
	13	 Quiet when Twitter’s not 
working! (4,4)
	15	 Investigation of mine 
accident concealed by authority 
(10)
	16	 Disengage from Uruguay 
National Party (4)
	18	 Filling in burrito’s honestly 
rubbish (4)
	20	Fairly certain moving upset 
Terry (6,4)
	22	Correctly moreover, 
describing Duke as wealthy (4-
2-2)
	24	When in charge, going by 
book’s essential (5)
	26	Put in order again for proper 
gin cocktail (7)
	27	Clipped cat reversing and hit 
parking light (3,4)
	28	Genuineness of gold in 
those days originally tested in 
financial district (12)

DOWN

	2	 Look up rising market prices, 
principally this speeds up 
inflation (3,4)
	3	 Nippers with zest were 
running wild! (8)
	4	 Leaving without one’s award 
(4)
	5	 Emotional confusion of OAP 
in East Enders finale’s piercing 
(10)
	6	 Cool American beefcake 
finally gets engaged (2,3)
	7	 Those people with 
spectacles have name for 
satellite (3,4)
	8	 Old racer in TT wearies, 
collapsing after taking flag (6,7)
	9	 Essence of a map puzzle is 
finding exit (5,2,6)
	14	 Recklessness gets rogue, 
lacking in respect, regularly 
nicked (10)
	17	 Second year doctor with 
stomach ache, heading off, is 
significant (8)
	19	 Dried fruit and nut salad 
surprisingly left by daughter (7)
	21	 Social climber gets high with 
famous model (7)
	23	 Stigma around Artificial 
Intelligence is explosive (5)
	25	Disease caused by hole in 
intestine (4)
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